

BID OPENING SHEET

Requisition No.

Bid Reference

S-1347

Department

Contracts & Campus
Purchasing

Description

Temporary Surg Tech/Ultrasound Tech Staffing Services

Bid Opening

March 23, 2021 at 2:00 PM EST
SUNY Upstate Medical University
Contracts & Campus Purchasing
650 South Salina Street
Syracuse, NY 13202

	<u>Vendors Solicited</u>	<u>Proposed Rates:</u>
1	Advantis Medical	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>66.64</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>81.42</u>
2	AMN Healthcare, Inc.	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>58.00</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>84.60</u>
3	CHG Medical Staffing, Inc.	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ no bid
4	Cynet Health	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>49.92</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>62.92</u>
5	Health Carousel	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ no bid
6	Infojini, Inc.	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>60.00</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>75.00</u>
7	Medical Solutions	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>68.40</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>84.60</u>
8	Nursing New York, LLC	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ mailed late did not arrive
9	Remede Consulting Group, Inc.	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>61.20</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>84.60</u>

BID OPENING SHEET

Requisition No. Bid Reference S-1347 Department Contracts & Campus Purchasing

Description Temporary Surg Tech/Ultrasound Tech Staffing Services

Bid Opening March 23, 2021 at 2:00 PM EST
 SUNY Upstate Medical University
 Contracts & Campus Purchasing
 650 South Salina Street
 Syracuse, NY 13202

10	RightSourcing	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ <i>No Bid</i>
11	Staff Today, Inc.	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ <i>No Bid</i>
12	Sunbelt Staffing	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>69.30</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>97.20</u>
13	Talent4Health	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>53.28</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>65.12</u>
14	Triage, LLC	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ <i>mailed late did not receive on time</i>
15	Trusted Nurse Staffing, LLC	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>52.50</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>60.00</u>
16	United Staffing Solutions	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>44.10</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>58.80</u>
17	Virtelligence	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____ <i>No Bid</i>

BID OPENING SHEET

Requisition No.	Bid Reference S-1347	Department	Contracts & Campus Purchasing
Description	Temporary Surg Tech/Ultrasound Tech Staffing Services		
Bid Opening	March 23, 2021 at 2:00 PM EST SUNY Upstate Medical University Contracts & Campus Purchasing 650 South Salina Street Syracuse, NY 13202		

18	Workfit Medical, LLC	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____
19	Worldwide Travel Staffing Limited	Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ <u>87.50</u> Ultrasound Tech- \$ <u>106.25</u>
		Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____
		Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____
		Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____
		Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____
		Bill Rates: Surgical Tech- \$ _____ Ultrasound Tech- \$ _____

NO BID

BID OPENING SHEET

Requisition No.	Bid Reference	S-1347	Department	Contracts & Campus Purchasing
Description	Temporary Surg Tech/Ultrasound Tech Staffing Services			
Bid Opening	March 23, 2021 at 2:00 PM EST SUNY Upstate Medical University Contracts & Campus Purchasing 650 South Salina Street Syracuse, NY 13202			

I certify bids were opened on the date, time and place specified above.

Authorized Signature: Kim Graziano 3/23/21
Title: **Kim Graziano**
Contract Administrator